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Voting for the 
Sunday Observer 
Most Popular 
C o n t e s t a n t 
begins today!

The Sunday 
Observer invites 

you to send in your votes fast.  
The  bevy of girls featured today 

are the twelve finalists for the all 
important Miss Derana Sri Lanka 
2012 and each one has a beauty that 
shines.  So don’t delay - the coupon is 
published on this page.

In the New Year, Derana comes 
back strong to present  their much 
awaited annual Derana Veet Miss Sri 
Lanka for Miss World 2012.  

The contestants during the  past 
couple of weeks went  through a hec-
tic program of selection what with 
many walks up and  down the cat-
walk, camera shoots, interviews,  
instructions on make-up and hair 
styling and long hours of  anxious  
waiting for their moment to be in the 
spotlight.

The Hotel Blue Waters, Wadduwa 

was a showpiece for the 1st mini 
pageant of Derana Veet Miss Sri 
Lanka 2012 which took place last 
week.  

Miss Beautiful Skin which was 
sponsored by Veet,  resulted in 
twelve finalists participating in the 
event. Their skin was scrutinised 
critically by a panel of judges com-
prising Beautician and Hair Stylist 
Ramzi Rahman, Popular actress 
Shashini Ayendra and Brand Manag-
er of Veet Krishantha Jonathan. 
Twelve finalists were  selected.
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